
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

City of Gosnells

CITY OF GOSNELLS AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 2025

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995, and under all other powers 
enabling it, the Council of the City of Gosnells resolved on [Date] to make the following local 
law.

CONTENT

PART 1—PRELIMINARY
PART 2—CITY OF GOSNELLS PUBLIC HEALTH LOCAL LAW 2017
PART 3—CITY OF GOSNELLS FENCING LOCAL LAW 2017
PART 4—CITY OF GOSNELLS DOGS LOCAL LAW 2020
PART 5—CITY OF GOSNELLS PARKING LOCAL LAW 2012

PART 1—PRELIMINARY

1.1 Title

This local law is the City of Gosnells Amendment Local Law 2025.

1.2 Commencement

This local law comes into operation 14 days after the date of its publication in the Government 
Gazette.

1.3 Application

This local law applies throughout the district.

1.4 Local Laws amended

This local law amends the City of Gosnells Public Health Local Law 2017, the City of Gosnells 
Fencing Local Law 2017, the City of Gosnells Dogs Local Law 2020, and the City of Gosnells 
Parking Local Law 2012.

PART 2—CITY OF GOSNELLS PUBLIC HEALTH LOCAL LAW 2017

2.1 City of Gosnells Public Health Local Law 2017 amended

This part of the local law amends the City of Gosnells Public Health Local Law 2017.

2.2 Clause 8.3(3) amended

Clause 8.3(3) is amended by deleting “$5,000” and replacing it with “$10,000”.

2.3 SCHEDULE 1 – PRESCRIBED OFFENCES amended

SCHEDULE 1 – PRESCRIBED OFFENCES is amended as follows—

(1) In Item 34 of the table, delete the modified penalty value of “500” and replace it 
with “1,000”.

Version: 1, Version Date: 25/07/2025
Document Set ID: 8825911



(2) In Item 35 of the table, delete the modified penalty value of “500” and replace it 
with “1,000”.

(3) In Item 36 of the table, delete the modified penalty value of “250” and replace it 
with “1,000”.

(4) In Item 39 of the table, delete the modified penalty value of “250” and replace it 
with “1000”.

PART 3—CITY OF GOSNELLS FENCING LOCAL LAW 2017

3.1 City of Gosnells Fencing Local Law 2017 amended

This part of the local law amends the City of Gosnells Fencing Local Law 2017.

3.2 Clause 5.1 amended

Clause 5.1 is amended as follows—

(1) Delete “$250” and replace it with “$500”.
(2) Delete “$5,000” and replace it with “$10,000”.

PART 4—CITY OF GOSNELLS DOGS LOCAL LAW 2020

4.1 City of Gosnells Dogs Local Law 2020 amended

This part of the local law amends the City of Gosnells Dogs Local Law 2020.

4.2 Schedule 3 – OFFENCES IN RESPECT OF WHICH MODIFIED PENALTY APPLIES 
amended

Schedule 3 – OFFENCES IN RESPECT OF WHICH MODIFIED PENALTY APPLIES is 
amended as follows—

(1) In Item 1 of the table, delete the modified penalty value of “150” and replace it 
with “200”.

(2) In Item 2 of the table, delete the modified penalty value of “100” and replace it 
with “200”.

PART 5—CITY OF GOSNELLS PARKING LOCAL LAW 2012

5.1 City of Gosnells Parking Local Law 2012 amended

This part of the local law amends the City of Gosnells Parking Local Law 2012.

5.2 Clause 1.4 amended

Clause 1.4 is amended by inserting the following definitions in alphabetical order—

“electric personal transporter has the meaning given to it in the Code;

electric rideable device has the meaning given to it in the Code;

electric vehicle means a vehicle that—

Version: 1, Version Date: 25/07/2025
Document Set ID: 8825911



(a) is powered by an electric motor or motors; and
(b) can be recharged from an external source of electricity,

but does not include an electric personal transporter or electric ridable device;

electric vehicle charging bay means a parking bay designated by a sign for the use of 
electric vehicles, with an external source of electricity available for charging an electric vehicle 
stopped or parked at that bay;”

5.3 New clause 7.7 added

After clause 7.6, add a new clause 7.7 as follows—

“7.7 Parking in electric vehicle charging bays

(1) A driver must not stop or park a vehicle in an electric vehicle charging bay 
unless the vehicle is—

(a) an electric vehicle; and 
(b) connected to the external source of electricity available for that electric 

vehicle charging bay for the purpose of charging the vehicle.

(2) Unless otherwise signed, a person may not park in a designated electric vehicle 
charging bay for longer than 2 continuous hours.”

5.4 Clause 9.1(2) amended

Clause 9.1(2) is amended by deleting “$5,000” and replacing it with “$10,000”.

5.5 Schedule 1 – Prescribed offences amended

In Schedule 1 – Prescribed offences, insert the following rows in the table after CLAUSE 7.6—

7.7(1)(a) Stopping or parking a vehicle other than an electric vehicle in an 
electric vehicle charging bay 100

7.7(1)(b)
Stopping or parking an electric vehicle in an electric vehicle 
charging bay when the vehicle is not connected to the external 
source of electricity for that bay

100

7.7(2) Stopping or parking for longer than 2 hours in an electric vehicle 
charging bay 100

DATED: __________________________2025

The Common Seal of the City of Gosnells was affixed by authority of a resolution of the Council 
in the presence of—

Version: 1, Version Date: 25/07/2025
Document Set ID: 8825911



__________________________________
TERRESA LYNES
MAYOR

__________________________________
IAN COWIE PSM
CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER

Version: 1, Version Date: 25/07/2025
Document Set ID: 8825911


